

# Oxy Operations Summary

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/8/23	9:00	10:00	1	FORM 17 TEST AND SAMPLE COLLECTED, SC START 23 PSI AND SC END WHISPER SC PRODUCED 1/10 GAL OF WATER.	
1/8/24	12:00	15:00	3	SUMMIT SITP 1400 SICP 1100 FL NOT DETECTED RIHW/ 2" JUC STACK OUT @ 0FT DROP METHONAL RIHW/ 1.875" LIB STACK OUT @ 0FT SIDE WAS CUT UP RIHW/ 1.75" LIB STACK OUT @ 7596' SHOWED TOOLS WE DID NOT FISH TOOLS OUT TALK TO SETH RDMO	
1/9/24	7:00	8:00	1	FORM 17 TEST SC PRODUCED 1/10 GAL OF WATER. SC START 6 PSI AND SC END 0 PSI.	
1/25/24	7:00	7:00	0	FORM 42: Approved Start Date: Tuesday, January 30, 2024, at 10:00 AM Form 6: Expires on 2/2/24 Form 4: N/A FAA Permit: N/A BLM: No Form 17: Completed 1/9/24 Sample: N/A WARS Update: Complete	
1/26/24	7:00	10:00	3	LONE TREE SERVICES TO INSTALL A STRING FENCE FOR OPS AREA AND LEVEL FOR THE BASE BEAM. JOMAX TO DELIVER DOZER & ASSIST WITH RIG MOVING OFF LOCATION.	
1/30/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC.	
1/30/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING WITH RIG CREW	
1/30/24	6:45	8:00	1.25	FINISH PICKING UP LOCATION. MOVE EQUIPMENT TO NEXT LOC.	
1/30/24	8:00	9:25	1.42	SPON IN EQUIPMENT. RIG CONTAINMENTS. RIG TANKS. PUMP. BASE BEAM AND WO RIG.	
1/30/24	9:25	11:00	1.58	RU WO RIG. LAY DOWN PUMP LINES AND PRESS TEST TO 2500 PSI. LINES TEST OK.	
1/30/24	11:00	11:10	0.17	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 10 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 1200 (PSI). TUBING: 1200 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
1/30/24	11:10	12:15	1.08	RU PUMP LINES AND BULLHEAD WELL KILL WELL WITH 160BBLs. PUMP 120 DOWN PROD CASING. 40BBLs DOWN PROD TBG.	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
1/30/24	12:15	13:00	0.75	NU 5K RIG BOP ON 5K STUMP. PRESS TEST 2 3/8 PIPE AND BLIND RAMS TO 250 PSI LOW FOR 10 MIN. 5K HIGH FOR 10 MIN. CHART PRESS. MONITOR WELL WHILE TESTING BOP NO GAS OR FLUID MIGRATION	
1/30/24	13:00	14:00	1	RIG DOWN WH MASTER VALVE. NU 5K RIG BOP TORQUE AND TEST CONNECTIONS. RU WORK FLOOR. AND GET TBG EQUIPM.	
1/30/24	14:00	16:00	2	UNLAND 2 3/8 PROD TBG. PULL TBG TO DERRICK WHILE LOADING WELL. WITH H2O/BIO PUMP 2BBLs EVERY 1000' OF TBG OUT.	
1/30/24	16:00	16:30	0.50	SHUT WELL IN AND WINTERIZE EQUIPMENT	
1/30/24	16:30	17:00	0.50	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD.	
1/31/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC,	
1/31/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING W/ RIG CREW AND WL CREW	
1/31/24	6:45	7:00	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 15 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
1/31/24	7:00	7:30	0.50	SPOT IN WL EQUIPMENT. HELD JSA MEEITNG WITH RIG CREW AND WL CREW RU WL EQUIP. SHEAVES. LUBE AND 5K FLANGE ADAPTER	
1/31/24	7:30	8:30	1	PU 3.625"OD GAUGE RING. RIH DOWN TO 7600'. POH. LD TOOLS	
1/31/24	8:30	9:30	1	PU 3.60"OD 10K SET AT 7590'. PN 000-3500-002 SN 23-1361. POH LD TOOLS	
1/31/24	9:30	10:15	0.75	PU CMT BAILER. MIX AND RIH W/ 2SX OF 50/50 CMT DUMP BAIL CMT ON TOP OF CIBP AT 7590'. POH. LD TOOL.	
1/31/24	10:15	11:00	0.75	PU 3.125"OD 4' 4SPF OWEN. TAG- 3123-346. 22.7G. 46" EH 60D SHOOT HOLES AT 7094'. POH	
1/31/24	11:00	11:45	0.75	PU 3.59"OD 10K WY COMP CICR. RIH AND SET AT 7024'. POH	
1/31/24	11:45	12:40	0.92	PU 2ND 3.125"OD 4' 4SPF DP OWEN TAG 3123-346 22.7G 46"EH. 60D. SHOOT HOLES AT 4210' LD TOOLS	
1/31/24	12:40	13:00	0.33	RIG DOWN WL EQUIP AND MOVE OFF LOC	
1/31/24	13:00	15:00	2	PU CICR STINGER. RIH ON PROD. STING INTO CICR W/ 229 JTS + 16' OF PUP JTS.	
1/31/24	15:00	15:20	0.33	PERFORM INJECTION TEST (WITH CICR).	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
1/31/24	15:20	16:15	0.92	STING OUT OF CICR. ESTABLISH CIRC WITH 12BBLS. CIRC WELL 2X HOLE VOL. 140 BBLs.	
1/31/24	16:15	16:30	0.25	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING.CMT COMPANY: (NEXTIER).	
1/31/24	16:30	17:30	1	PUMP 100 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.52 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (NIO BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (NO), TOC 6747 FT, BOC 7094 FT SQUEEZE: (YES), EQUIPMENT: (CICR) DEPTH: 7024 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 7094 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 6760FT	
1/31/24	17:30	18:00	0.50	STING OUT OF CICR. CIRC WELL CLEAN 1X HOLES VOL. SHUT WELL IN	
1/31/24	18:00	18:30	0.50	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD	
2/1/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC.	
2/1/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING W/ RIG CREW	
2/1/24	6:45	7:00	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
2/1/24	7:00	8:30	1.50	OPEN WELL AND TOO H W/ PROD TBG. LD 24 JTS IN TBG TRAILER. PULL 134JTS TO DERRICK	
2/1/24	8:30	9:45	1.25	PU 3.59"OD 10K WY COMP CICR. RIH ON PROD TBG. SET AT 4150' W/ 135JTS	
2/1/24	9:45	10:10	0.42	RU PUMP LINES. ESTABLISH CIRC W/ 10BBLS. GET INJ RATE OF 2BPM @ 2800PSI. 5 BBLs TOTAL	
2/1/24	10:10	10:10	0	PERFORM INJECTION TEST (WITH CICR).	
2/1/24	10:10	10:40	0.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING.CMT COMPANY: (NEXTIER).	
2/1/24	10:40	11:45	1.08	PUMP 100 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.17 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (NO), TOC 3944 FT, BOC 4210 FT SQUEEZE: (YES), EQUIPMENT: (CICR) DEPTH: 4150 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 4210 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 3944 FT	
2/1/24	11:45	12:30	0.75	STING OUT OF CICR. LD 15 JTS AND RU PUMP LINES. ESTABLISH CIRC. REVERCE CIRC WELL CLEAN W/ 120	
2/1/24	12:30	13:30	1	TAKE WASHINGTON RUBBER OFF. LD 50 JTS IN TBG TRAILER. STAND BACK 70JTS ON DERRICK.	
2/1/24	13:30	15:00	1.50	LOAD WELL WITH H2O/BIO. HELP CLEANING MUD TANK WIRH CLEAN WATER.	
2/1/24	15:00	15:30	0.50	WINTERIZE EQUIP. SHUT WELLIN	
2/1/24	15:30	16:00	0.50	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
2/2/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC,	
2/2/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING W/ RIG CREW AND WL CREW	
2/2/24	6:45	7:00	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
2/2/24	7:00	7:30	0.50	SPOT IN WL. EQUIP. RD WASHINGTON HEAD. RU WL TOOLS. SHEAVES. LUBE. 5K FLANGE ADAPER.	
2/2/24	7:30	8:30	1	PU LOGGING TOOL. RIG AND LOG FROM 3300' TO SURFACE. SEND LOG TO ENGINEER. LD TOOLS.	
2/2/24	8:30	9:30	1	PU 2 3.125"OD 4' 4SPF. BIG HOLE PREF GUNS OWEN 60D. .59EH. 20G. SHOOT HOLES AT 2800' & 2096'. DUE TO COLLAR AT 2104' POH. LD TOOLS.	
2/2/24	9:30	9:50	0.33	RIG DOWN WL AND MOVE OFF LOCATION.	
2/2/24	9:50	10:25	0.58	PU 4.5"OD 32A PKR W/ UNLOADER. SET PKR AT 2160' W/ 70 JTS	
2/2/24	10:25	12:25	2	ESTABLISH CIRC W/ 22BLS. GET GAS. LIGH MUD AND SHELL. CIRC WELL CLEAN FOR 2HRS AT 2.5BPM. 300BLS.	
2/2/24	12:25	13:00	0.58	RELEASE PKR & POOH.	
2/2/24	13:00	13:35	0.58	PU 3.59"OD 10K CICR. RIH AND SET AT 2160' W/ 70 JTS.	
2/2/24	13:35	14:00	0.42	RUPUMP LINES. CIRC HSF OUT.	
2/2/24	14:00	14:20	0.33	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING.CMT COMPANY: (NEXTIER).	
2/2/24	14:20	15:40	1.33	PUMP 230 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.20 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (NO), TOC 1954 FT, BOC 2800 FT SQUEEZE: (YES), EQUIPMENT: (CICR) DEPTH: 2160 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 2800 FT, TOP (PERF): 2096 FT, TOC IN CSG: 1954FT	
2/2/24	15:40	16:25	0.75	STING OUT OF CICR AT 2160'. PUH TO 1852' W/ 60 JTS. RU PUMP LINES. CIRC WELL CLEAN.	
2/2/24	16:25	17:30	1.08	LD TOTAL OF 22 JTS ON TRAILER. PULL 38 JTS TO DERRICK.	
2/2/24	17:30	18:00	0.50	SHUT WELL IN. WINTERIZE EQUIP.	
2/2/24	18:00	18:30	0.50	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD	
2/5/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC.	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
2/5/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING WITH RIG CREW AND WL CREW WAIT FOR FOG TO CLEAR UP	
2/5/24	6:45	7:00	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
2/5/24	7:00	8:00	1	SPOT IN WL. RU WL TOOLS. SHEAVES. LUBE AND FLANGE ADAPTER. GET PERF GUNS READY AND WAIT FOR COLLAR LOCATOR	
2/5/24	8:00	8:45	0.75	PU AND RIH W/ 2 3.125"OD 4' 4SPF OWEN TAG-3375-301 4.7"PEN. .59"EH. SHOOT HOLES AT 1800' & 1150'	
2/5/24	8:45	9:10	0.42	RIG DOWN WL EQUIPMENT MOVE OFF	
2/5/24	9:10	10:00	0.83	PU 4.5"OD 32A PKR. RIH AND SET AT 1210' W/ 39 JTS.	
2/5/24	10:00	13:00	3	RU PUMP LINES. ESTABLISH CIRC. CIRC WELL FOR 3HRS AT 2.5BPM. (450BBLs). GET GAS OUT. HEAVY MUD AND SHELL.	
2/5/24	13:00	14:30	1.50	CHANGE OVER LINES AND ESTABLISH CIRC FROM 1800' HOLES UP SURFACE CASING. CIRC FOR 1.5 HRS. AT 2BPM 180BBLs. GET CLEAN PROD WATER AND GAS OUT.	
2/5/24	14:30	16:00	1.50	CHANGE OVER PUMP LINES AND CONTINUE CIRCULATING WELL BETWEEN HOLES. CLEAN PKR UNLOADER AND SPOT 55BBLs OF HSF	
2/5/24	16:00	16:30	0.50	RELEASE PKR AND LD 6JTS ON TBG TRAILER.	
2/5/24	16:30	17:00	0.50	SHUT WELL IN. WINTERIZE EQUIP.	
2/5/24	17:00	17:30	0.50	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD	
2/6/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC,	
2/6/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING WITH RIG CREW AND TOOL HAND	
2/6/24	6:45	7:00	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
2/6/24	7:00	7:30	0.50	OPEN WELL. PU 6 JTS OF 2 3/8 PROD TBG. LOWER PKR AND RESET AT 1210'.	
2/6/24	7:30	9:30	2	RU PUMP LINES AND CIRC WELL FOR 2HRS AT 2.5BPM AT 440'. GET SHELL OUT.	
2/6/24	9:30	10:30	1	CHANGE OVER CIRC AND CIRCULATE FROM 1800' TO SURFACE AT 1HRS AT 2.5BPM. AT 510PSI. NO GAS	
2/6/24	10:30	11:00	0.50	TOH AND LAY DOWN PACKER, TIH AND SET CIRC 1210'.	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
2/6/24	11:00	12:30	1.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING.CMT COMPANY: (NEXTIER).	
2/6/24	12:30	13:30	1	PUMP 225 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.20 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (NO), TOC 1004 FT, BOC 1800 FT SQUEEZE: (YES), EQUIPMENT: (CICR) DEPTH: 1210 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 1800 FT, TOP (PERF): 1800 FT, TOC IN CSG: 1004FT	
2/6/24	13:30	16:00	2.50	STING OUT OF CICR. LAY DOWN 10 JTS AND CIRC WELL CLEAN. GET EQUIPMENT OUT OF LOCATION USING A WINCH TRUCK TO HELP CMT EQUIPMENT GET OUT OF LOC.	
2/6/24	16:00	16:45	0.75	PULLING TBG TO DERRICK (30 JTS) SHUT WELL IN.	
2/6/24	16:45	17:30	0.75	FINISH WINTERIZING EQUIP. RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD	
2/7/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC.	
2/7/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING WITH RIG CREW	
2/7/24	6:45	7:00	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
2/7/24	7:00	7:40	0.67	PU 4.5"OD MECHANICAL CUTTER. RIH ON TBG AND TAG TOC @ 933' W/ 31 JTS	
2/7/24	7:40	8:34	0.90	PRESSURE TEST DOWN: (PRODUCTION CASING). TEST INTERVAL BOTTOM: (CEMENT TOP) AT 933 FT TEST INTERVAL TOP: (SURFACE) AT 0 FT PRESSURE TEST TO: 500 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES. TEST RESULTS: (PASS)	
2/7/24	8:00	8:20	0.33	RAISE TBG TO 820' W/ 27 JTS.	
2/7/24	8:00	8:00	0	13HR OVERNIGHT BUILD UPI TEST CONDUCTED. NEXT MORNING ALL VALVES SHOWED 0 PSI. WITH NO LELS OR SIGNS OF GAS MIGRATION.	
2/7/24	8:20	9:00	0.67	SPOT IN P-SWIVEL AND RIG UP	
2/7/24	9:00	10:00	1	CUT 4.5"OD PROD CASING AT 820'. RIG DOWN SWIVEL AND MOVE OFF	
2/7/24	10:00	10:20	0.33	TOOH W/ TBG. LD CASING CUTTER.	
2/7/24	10:20	11:00	0.67	RIG DOWN WORK FLOOR AND ND 5K RIG BOP	
2/7/24	11:00	12:00	1	UNLAND PROD CASING W/ CASING SPEAR. GET READY TO NU 9" BOP	
2/7/24	12:00	13:00	1	NU 9" 3K ENSIGN BOP RIG UP WORK FLOOR	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
2/7/24	13:00	14:30	1.50	WAIT FOR CASING EQUIP PIPE WRANGLER AND LOADER	
2/7/24	14:30	15:30	1	SPOT IN PIPE WRANGLER AND GET READY TO START LAYING DOWN CASING	
2/7/24	15:30	16:10	0.67	TOOH AND LAD TOTAL OF 19 JTS OF CASING ON PIPE WRANGLER AND TRANSFER TO CASING TRAILER.	
2/7/24	16:10	17:00	0.83	SHUT WELL IN. CHANGE OVER EQUIP TO 2 3/8. WINTERIZE EQUIP	
2/7/24	17:00	17:30	0.50	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD	
2/8/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC.	
2/8/24	6:30	6:45	0.25	HELD JSA MEETING W/ RIG CREW	
2/8/24	6:45	7:00	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
2/8/24	7:00	7:30	0.50	TIH W/ 2 3/8 DIVERTER TOOL. DOWN TO 820' W/ 27 JTS	
2/8/24	7:30	8:15	0.75	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING.CMT COMPANY: (NEXTIER).	
2/8/24	8:15	8:45	0.50	HELD JSA MEETING WITH RIG CREW AND CMT CREW RIG UP CMT LINES	
2/8/24	8:45	9:30	0.75	PUMP 120 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.20 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 515 FT, BOC 820 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 0 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 515FT	
2/8/24	9:30	10:00	0.50	PUH TO 285' W/ 9 JTS AND CIRC WELL CLEAN	
2/8/24	10:00	11:00	1	TOOH. LD DIVERTER TOOL. PU 8 5/8 CSG SRAPER. RIH DOWN TO 308 W/ 10 JTS. POH AND LD SCRAPER.	
2/8/24	11:00	11:35	0.58	SHUT WELL IN. WINTERIZE EQUIP.	
2/8/24	11:35	12:30	0.92	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO YARD	
2/9/24	5:30	6:30	1	RIG CREW TRAVEL TO LOC.	
2/9/24	6:30	7:00	0.50	HELD JSA MEETING WITH RIG CREW	
2/9/24	7:00	7:15	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 PSI. PRODUCTION CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING: 0 (NA).	
2/9/24	7:15	8:00	0.75	PU 2 3/8 TBG AND RIH. TAG TOC AT 480 W/ 16 JTS 12' OUT LAY DOWN ONE JOINT AND RU PUMP LINES.	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
2/9/24	8:00	8:20	0.33	PRESSURE TEST DOWN: (SURFACE CASING). TEST INTERVAL BOTTOM: (CEMENT TOP) AT 480 FT TEST INTERVAL TOP: (SURFACE) AT 0 FT PRESSURE TEST TO: 500 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES. TEST RESULTS: (PASS)	
2/9/24	8:20	8:45	0.42	TOOH AND LA DOWN TBG ON TRAILER.	
2/9/24	8:45	9:00	0.25	SPOT IN WL EQUIPMENT. HELD JSA MEETING WITH CREWS	
2/9/24	9:00	9:30	0.50	PU 8 5/8 CIBP. RIH AND SET AT 260' POH LD TOOLS	
2/9/24	9:30	9:45	0.25	RIG DOWN WL EQUIPMENT. MOVE OFF	
2/9/24	9:45	10:00	0.25	PU 2 3/8 DIVERTER TOOL. TIH AND TAG CIBP @ 260'.	
2/9/24	10:00	10:35	0.58	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING.CMT COMPANY: (NEXTIER).	
2/9/24	10:35	11:30	0.92	PUMP 100 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.21 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 10 FT, BOC 260 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 0 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 10FT	
2/9/24	11:30	12:00	0.50	PUH AND PU 10' PUMP JT. RU PUMP LINES AND CIRC WELL CLEAN.	
2/9/24	12:00	13:15	1.25	RIG DOWN WORK FLOOR. ND 9" BOP GET EQUIP OUT OF LOC	
2/9/24	13:15	15:00	1.75	RACK PUMP AND TANKS LINES RIG DOWN BRIGADE 11 AND MOVE OFF LOCATION.	
2/9/24	15:00	16:00	1	MOVE EQUIPMENT TO BRIGADE YARD.	
2/9/24	16:00	16:00	0	COA: P&A OPERATIONS TOOK PLACE OUTSIDE OF WINDOW OF CONCERN	
2/9/24	16:00	16:00	0	COA: LEAVE AT LEAST 100' OF CEMENT IN THE WELLBORE FOR EACH PLUG WITHOUT MECHANICAL ISOLATION	
2/9/24	16:00	16:00	0	COA: DUE TO PROXITMITY TO A WETLAND, SURFACE WATER AND EXPECTED SHALLOW GROUNDWATER, OPERATOR WILL USE SECONDARY CONTAINMENT FOR ALL TANKS AND OTHER LIQUID CONTAINERS	
2/9/24	16:00	16:00	0	COA: OPERATOR SHALL IMPLEMENT MEASURES TO CONTROL VENTING, TO PROTECT HEATH & SAFETY, AND O ENSURE THAT VAPORS AND ORDORS FROM WELL PLUGGING OPERATIONS DO NOT CONSTITUTE A HAZARD TO PUBLIC WELFARE.	
2/9/24	16:00	16:00	0	COA: WITH THE FORM 6 SRA OPERATOR MUST PROVIDE WRITTEN DOCUMENTATION WHICH POSITIVELY AFFIRMS EACH COA LISTED	
2/9/24					
2/27/24	8:00	9:00	1	DUG UP SURFACE CASING	
2/27/24	8:00	9:00	1	(VISUAL) CHECK FOR 15 MINUTES. ISOLATION CONFIRMED (YES)OTHER METHOD:	

Well:	WEST FARMS 22-14			Spud Date:	11/8/2004 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	WEST FARMS 22-14
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	BRIGADE 11
Start Date:	1/30/24			End Date:	2/27/24
Datum:	RKB @ 4802			Well UWI:	0512322416
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
2/27/24	9:00	10:00	1	CUT CASING 6' BELOW GL, CEMENT AT SURFACE	
2/27/24	10:00	11:00	1	CAPPED CASING WITH A METAL PLATE CONTAINING WELL INFO	
2/27/24	11:00	12:00	1	BACKFILLED	
2/27/24	12:00	12:00	0	PLACED MARKER BALL	